
NATURAL JEWELS OF THE CARIBBEAN-NORTHBOUND – 8 DAYS/7 NIGHTS 

 

DAY 1- GRENADA 

Our adventure starts today! We will be at the meeting point by 16:00 to transfer to Klara. After 
embarking and settling into our cabins, we will gather for cocktails to meet our fellow travellers, 
followed by dinner.Grenada is often referred to as the “Spice Isle,” as it is home to numerous 
nutmeg plantations. St. George is the island’s capital and showcases colourful homes, Georgian 
buildings and early-18th-century Fort George overlooking Carenage Harbour. Spectacular 
waterfalls and beaches, lush botanical gardens, mystic rainforests, and friendly people at every 
turn, will give us an introduction to the amazing places we will be visiting during our journey. 

Meals: Dinner 

DAY 2 – ST VICENT AND THE GRENADIERS 

Today we plan to land at the Blue Lagoon harbour to visit the King’s Hill Forest Reserve.King’s Hill 
Forest Reserve was established by way of act on April 2nd, 1791. Considered one of the oldest 
forest reserves in the Western Hemisphere, it is home to a variety of trees and shrubs and provides 
a home for protected wildlife. 

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch and Dinner 

 

DAY 3 – ST LUCIA 

Saint Lucia, with her blend of beauty and mystique, enchants every visitor who steps onto her 
shores. As the only sovereign nation named after a woman, Saint Lucia embodies a spirit of 
adventure and inspiration. Visitors to this tropical paradise often find themselves deeply touched 
by its allure, making them both reluctant to leave and eager to return.Today we plan to call into 
Marigot Bay, an off the beaten track seaside settlement, located on the edge of a sheltered inlet, 
lined by hills it offers some spectacular hiking trails.  

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch and Dinner 

DAY 4 – MARTINIQUE 

The island of Martinique with a rich colonial past, offers a mix of leisure and adventure, showcasing 
idyllic beaches located steps away from historical sites and lush mountains. Waters surrounding 
Martinique have a rich diverse marine life, we may even spot a large pod of dolphins playing 
around. Today we plan to visit Les Anses D’Arlet, a charming fishing community with traditional 
Creole houses made of coloured wood and peeling tiles. Along the shore skiffs and nets are a 
reminder of a working fishermen’s village. 

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch and Dinner 



 

DAY 5 – GUADELOUPE 

Today we plan to call into Basse-Terre, nestled within a volcanic range crowned by La Soufrière, it is 
surrounded by dense tropical vegetation. The 17,000 hectares of rainforest that cover the mountain 
range are part of the National Park, which boasts numerous hiking trails. These trails, some easily 
accessible through a rich ecosystem teeming with an impressive variety of endemic species. In this 
verdant paradise, you will find breathtaking waterfalls and a myriad of friendly species. 
Complementing its natural beauty, Basse-Terre is fringed with beaches of white, black, gold, and 
even pink sands. 

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch and Dinner 

DAY 6 – ANTIGUA 

Antigua ringed with coral reefs, is known for its sandy beaches ideal for snorkel and SUP. Set along 
English Harbour, you will find the restored Nelson’s Dockyard, which Admiral Horatio Nelson made 
his base in the 1780s, including a marina and the Dockyard Museum. As we kike up to Shirley 
Heights, a restored military lookout and gun battery. The Lookout is a high point (about 490 ft.), and 
it is said to boast the best views of English and Falmouth Harbours.Devil's Bridge is a natural rock 
arch located near Indian Town Point. Around the arch we will see natural blowholes which shoot up 
water and spray powered by waves from the Atlantic Ocean. 

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch and Dinner 

 

DAY 7 – NEVIS 

The first Indigenous habitants were the Arawak and the Carib. The Arawak named the Island 
Dulcina (sweet island), the Carib named it Oualie (land of beautiful waters). A few centuries later as 
it became a leading sugar producer, the name changed to Nevis (Queen of the Caribbees). The 
Botanical gardens are worth a visit, created by an American couple Joseph and Martha Murphy, 
displays sculptures, fountains, a replica of a Great House, a tropical rain forest conservatory design 
at the image of the conservatory at Kew Gardens in England. One will come away certain that Nevis 
is the hidden gem of the Caribbean Islands. Historical sites, ruins dating back to early 17th century, 
breathtaking landscapes, spectacular views from the top of Nevis Peak, bamboo fields, cocoa 
trees. rainforest waterfalls - Nevis has it all! 

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch and Dinner 

DAY 8 – ST KITTS 

Our adventure ends today! After breakfast we farewell our expedition team and fellow travellers and 
make our way to the airport/town. 

Meals: Breakfast 


